WESTERN

CONNECTICUT
STATE UNIVERSITY

Administrative Services
203-837-8758

Western Connecticut State University Bid # 2016-ERB-0291 for the supply of security equipment
for a two year period beginning July 2015, running through June 2017 with an option for a
possible 3d year to be exercised at the sole discretion of the University.

Locking Mechanisms are awarded to Tull Brothers of Rocky Hill CT using the following prices.

Access Control Equipment is awarded to Halifax Security dba North American Video of Brick NJ
and Johnson Controls of Rocky Hill CT using the following price lists.

CCTV Equipment is awarded to Halifax Security dba North American Video of Brick NJ and
Omni Data of West Haven CT.

181 White Street, Danbury CT. 06810



Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291Attachment A: Addendum No 1

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

WCSU Security System Equipment

**All Equipment Shall Be RoHS 2002/95/EC Compliant**

TULL

Manufacturer's

Description Item Number Qty. 1-10 Qty. 11-20 Warranty information
Enrmauim _

Electric Strike (HES) {12 or 24VDC) 1006-12/24D-630 .NN% b \Mﬂ.ﬁ % 228.— | MFz - = FAnA
Electric Strike (HES) (12 or 24VDC) 4500 4 Nknw.m.ﬁ Z 249

Elactric Strike (HES) (12 or 24VDC) 7501 HE 15D 25% a £ N.m.u.v 7

Electric Strike (HES) (12 or 24VDC) 9600-17/24-630 4 273 \.N\ sMMN.w[ ' . S T
Electric Strike (HES) (12 or 24VDC) 9400 & 225. 4 w\w@ ‘mw u\chw

Electric Strike [HES) {12 or 24VDC) 7501 14 wa.._.: ¥ 253

Electric Strike (HES) (12 or 24VDC) 9500 # N&QP@ £ 240

Faceplate (HES) 1 option “ \.\ nh\«x £ \.&.\. i

Faceplate (HES) -2 option \% Nho\ nhmu \W\N&m M\Q

Elactrical Power Transfer (Von Duprin) EPT-10, finish SP28 7 247 o #2107 =

Electrified Hinge 4.5%4.5 260D {McKinney) t423788cc8 26D- correct # TAA378BCCE 26D N AN.@ = $F ....n..h.

Electrified Hinge 4.5X4.5 {Stanley) FBB179-110426D &.\\.Wmm. M\.\M\ =

clertomechanicallocsel T0DC Corbinfusin [0z ecserescoen 1 IMZE0GIEE pa3s 0 433 B TR P
flectromechanical lockset 24VDC (Corbin Russwin ML2090124VDC Fail Safe W\Nam ﬁ 72 Z N‘Aw“ 2

Electromechanical lockset 24VDC (Corbin Russwin correct # is €133905-Nzb-Ct6-2a0C-M92-626 %.. U.nw,:\v\ L2 s&\ 2989 v o
.:mﬂSamnrm_..._nw_._onrwm.. 24YDC .._“....n.__._uw_.. Russwin Ci33905 NZD 626 m‘ .ann»_ V\L \m |M\..W£ _W¢ “ N\\.w 4..“.«

fiectromechanical lockset 24vDC (Corbin Russwin £D5200-9505-M34 MI2 fw. \Q.W\ m..w..\ L o3 ..wm\

_vmhn:; Strike 24VDC Fail Secure (Von Duprin) (12 or 24VDC) 6111 US320 FSE V4 .wnq.wﬂw A 357 2 \W 257 =

|slectric Strke 24VDC Fail Secure (Von Duprin} (210 US320 FSE m b\%m\d\ & &QW 2 \T%_“Mw

_ﬂ,..;,:_.. Strike 24vDC Fail Secure {Von Duprin] (12 or 24VDC) 6212 US320 FSE A &0“4%‘ % Hos .(Rtln|




“TuLL

Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291Attachment A: Addendum No 1 WCSU Security System Equipment

**All Equipment Shall Be RoHS 2002/95/EC Compliant**

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years Manufacturer's

Description Item Number Qty. 1-10 Qty. 11-20 Qty. 20+ - Narmanty Information
Electric Strike 24VDC Fail Secure (Von Duprin) {12 or 24VDC) 6112 US32D FSE Byps 4 405 |8 Hfos M STD
Electric Strike 24VDC Fail Secure {Von Duprin) {12 or 24VDC) 6211 US32D FSE \w. 24 Nm\w # wxwww 2 392 e i
Electric Strike Folger Adams (12 or 24VDC) 310-4 B 525 = & m‘wm.@mu £ v\m‘fﬂ%
Electric Strike Folger Adams (12 or 24VDC) 742-75-120-630 A NQW ' \N 225 =2 \ M\uv\mm
Electric Strike Folger Acums (120t 24V00) 712-75 2 NSWM & 260 23 £ 2&0 >
Electric Strike Folger Adams (12 or 24VDC) 712 b4 N&Qﬁd £ 200 2 .m\w &r\bﬁw
Eiectric Strike Folger Adams (12 or 24VDC) 732 Z Nm\w\ku £ N‘Aw\wd.m \v\ .N\m.@.m\ﬂ
|Etectric Strike Folger Adams (12 or 24VDC) 31041 & 535 il 4 ww&\ﬂu & .w\wv.\uwG
. Electric Strike Folger Adams (12 or 24VDC) 310-4 & 7196 7 % N@Rum. @2 N\Aw\mud&
Electric Strike Folger Adams {12 or 24VDC) 310-2 m _ u\\ur— %e, & ,u\.w._\kw g 27 4 m&.
Electric Strike Folger Adams (12 or 24VDC) 3103-1 4 w¢N@0 & N..mNmm. 4 nwwN&B
Strike Body without Faceplate option Folger Adams {12 or 24VDC) 310-1-(3/4)-24D ¢ 21 W.Qd V\ NL.V\Q“ é ..wa\o.\._ﬂ
Cortin Ruzswin Electrified Exit Device EDS200-M92 ﬁ 714 % % ib\m\&m 3 .h.\gx.,w‘@w”
kel R Flece ned £xit Degies P e N R K d&&wu V3 ...uwnmﬂ,ww_ %.J‘WW.H\
Corbin Russwin Electrified Trim with Trim Gastket N930S M99 # 29 u\:u Q\ 292 i # 292 “©
e ) 7] Gl
Delayad Egress Locking Devices (Corbin Russwin) EpszpOD . e ,TltM\t...nlm.W\I_mzﬁ| mfﬁa ....... & 1%.%1&1{[ RO |-
Delaved Egress Locking Devices (Corbin Russwin) £05200AD M51 MS8 M2 correct#eDs200a0M8emM92 | (F G S .hnw@ 4 g5/ % N«, G5 B
Smart-pac Il (HES) 2005 & 29 3 # 33 T £ 35 “
[smart-pac Il (HES) 2005M3 a 29 ML 29 ° & 25 .:% o
HES Spacer Plate 9400/9500/9600/-108 &_ _qu.m_ # ) 4 5/ \W_\ % &4 L




Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291Attachment A: Addendum No 1

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

WCSU Security System Equipment

**All Equipment Shall Be RoHS 2002/95/EC Compliant**

Tull

Manufacturer's

Description Item Number Qty. 1-10 Qty. 11-20 Qty. 20+ Warranty information

Viking Intercom E30EWP \c\ = \& a7

Viking Dor Entry and CCTV Control C-10008 { i

Viking Secure Relay SRC-1 __ \

Resitor Pack (Technical Systems Group) 5078700 ‘

GRI Resisior Pack 5644-1 K :

Flair Electronix Resistor Pack RP6644 h\ \

ﬁ |

Piezo PC300

Batteries NP7-12 A )

Door Alarm Unit {Designed Security Inc.) ES4200K4

Hold Up Switch (Ademca) 269R

Break Glass W/custom wording: "Door Lock” above glass, "Break Glass In Emergency”

below glass.{Security Door Controls) SDC 491

Camden Door Sequencer CX-5A1

GE 2500 Series Industrial Door Contact 2507A

Uil Suriae= Mount Door Contact 44074 i

GTI Miniature Surfacre Mount Contact 4462

GE Surface Mount Contact 5 1NBSTGY \ ~ e |1..:l_i - o
- - = [}

GE Rare Earth Magnet 1840 H\ b\

TOTAL SECTION

All equipment supplied must be new, unused and must be covered by current and existing manufacturer’s parts warranties
At time of purchase.Where applicable proposer shall supply warranty information with bid.

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years
Name of Company

Tull Prothens,

Date nWM\hv\rx,W\




Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291 Attachment A

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

WCSU Security System Equipment

**All Equipment Shall Be RoHS 2002/95/EC Compliant*®*

HALIFAX dba

\fb Q,mmc

Manufacturer's

Description

—:ma Number

_ Qty. 1-10

_ Qty. 11-20

Qty. 20+

Warranty information

Access Control Equipment

iStar EX (4 Doors) STAREX004W-64 265~ S casrs
b]

iStareX Upgrade 4 to 8 Rdrs STAREX008-UPG 413 -

istar {16 Doors) STAROO16W-64ANPS Y290 -

APC/8x 1MB Motherboard Only

AS0100-004MB

2089-

APC/L Motherboard Only

ASD101-003MB

813-

IStar PRO Main Board GCM

STAREX-GCM

\a54 -

iStar PRO ACM Board

STAR-ACMB-WA

ngH-

APC Star Coupler A50020-00 344 -

APC Wiegand Prox Star Coupler Board AS0054-00 Loo-

APC Wiegand Prox Star Coupler Daughter Card AS0054-01 g ~ ’
SW House Heater Kit for RM Readers 130-915 Py \ Wml -

SW House ARM-1 Aux Relay Module 131-912 f—-—. -

SW House RM Keypad 5108-0010-01 mm.l

SW House RM Replacement LCD Keypad 5108-0010-02 m |~ -

APS Power Supply AS0063-00 Y2\ -

Altronix 6A Power Supply

wesesmoem Al OO UL AC

20L~

LW hme

Altronix

ACMBCBE

X

hEehme

Power Supply (Corbin Russwin)

(prreck QalT W
R oo ~C5235607

Apollo Access Control Panel

A0 No Drd

Altronix PD8

PD8

18~

1 ._uﬂ.r._._sm




Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291 Attachment A

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

WCSU Security System Equipment

**All Equipment Shall Be RoHS 2002/95/EC Compliant**

Manufacturer's

Description Iltem Number Qty. 1-10 Qty. 11-20 Qty. 20+ Warranty information
SW House Enhanced RM-4 Board RM-4E 25% - 5 yrs

L)
SW House Personality Module RM-4 —jm = J
Softwarehouse RM4 Reader w/keypad (Indala) RM2-PI26 mww -
Softwarehouse RM4 Reader w/keypad & LCD {Indala) RM2-1-PI26 nhpr. -
Softwarehouse 8 output relay bus module AS0074-000 U-mm -
SW House RM Enclosure RM-DCM-CAN aﬁp\.
Flexpass beige Arch Wallswitch Proximity Reader (Indala) FP4527A uw —.l ~
FlexPass Indala Long Range Reader Black ASRG20+ .m!—m == f
Softwarehouse 8 Supervised input bus module A50073-000 213 - ‘/—\
Card Reader (Apollo) AP-510 e = —_— _
GE 1" Press Fit Door Contact r1078 N i S _ r»\.
GE 1" Press Fit Door Contact 1076w N —D - — “ '
$DC Door Contact MC-aM o 1 Vv
Honeywell Hardwired Hold-Up Switch 269R le— 2 rw S
Request to Exit DS-151-1 mw.l 3 r+_«;m
Request to Exit D§160 P mw - 3 /— S
TOTAL SECTION % 19531.po

All equipment supplied must be new, unused and must be covered by current and existing manufacturer’s parts warranties

At time of purchase.Where applicable proposer shall supply warranty information with bid.

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

Name of Company _|—|Q~.rn”pf_r W—PP\,K._..: f’n. ,V@Yl

North Omencarn Vi de

Date 2 __.N./__W



Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291 Attachment A

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

*%All Equi

WCSU Security System Equipment

ment Shall Be RoHS 2002/95/EC Com liant**

Manufacturer's

Description item Number [ ay.1-10 | Qty.11-20 [ ary.20+ |warranty formation. |
Access Control Equipment &
{Star EX (4 Doors) STAREX004W-64 $3,024.68 # $2,911.25 _ $2,840.24 1 Year
iStareX Upgrade 4 to 8 Rdrs STAREX008-UPG $1,103.90 _ $1,062.50 $1,036.59 1 Year L
iStar (16 Doors) STAROD16W-64ANPS $5,040.91 _ $4,851.88 $4,733.54 1 Year \ﬂ
APC/8x 1MB Motherboard Only AS0100-004MB $2,337.66 i $2,250.00 §2,195.12 1 Year \_
APC/L Motherboard Only AS0101-003MB $990.26 $953.13 $929.88 1 Year
{Star PRO Main Board GCM STAREX-GCM $2,218.18 $2,135.00 $2,082.93 1 Year L
{Star PRO ACM Board STAR-ACMB-WA $1,344.16 §1,293.75 §1,262.20 1 Year
APC Star Coupler AS0020-00 $389.61 $375.00 $365.85 1 Year
APC Wiegand Prox Star Coupler Board AS0054-00 $681.82 $656.25 $640.24 1 Year
APC Wiegand Prox Star Coupler Daughter Card AS0054-01 | $642.86 $618.75 $603.66 1 Year
SW House Heater Kit for RM Readers 130-915 $152.60 $146.88 $143.29 1 Year
SW House ARM-1 Aux Relay Module 131-912 $51.95 $50.00 $48.78 1 Year
SW House RM Keypad 5108-0010-01 $38.96 $37.50 $36.59 1 Year
ﬂa House RM Replacement LCD Keypad 5108-0010-02 $64.94 $62.50 $60.98 1 Year
APS Power Supply AS0063-00 §477.27 $459.38 §448.17 1 Year
Altronix 6A Power Supply ALE0OULXACM $248.05 $238.75 §232.93 1 Year
Altronix ACMBCBE $76.62 $73.75 $71.95 1 Year
power Supply (Corbin Russwin) 781N $385.56 $371.10 $362.05 1 Year
Apollo Access Control Panel AAM-80 $4,183.12 $4,026.25 $3,928.05 1 Year
|Altronix PD8 PD8 $20.78 $20.00 $19.51 1 Year

L INC



Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291 Attachment A

WCSU Security System Equipment

*# Al Equipment Shall Be RoHS 2002/95/EC Compliant**

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years Manufacturer's
Description Item Number Qty. 1-10 Qty. 11-20 Qty. 20+ Warranty information
SW House Enhanced RM-4 Board RM-4E $292.21 $281.25 §274.39 1 Year
SW House Personality Module RM-4 $220.78 $212.50 $207.32 1 Year
Softwarehouse RM4 Reader w/keypad (Indala) RM2-PI126 $610.39 $587.50 $573.17 1 Year
Softwarehouse RM4 Reader w/keypad & LCD (Indala) RM2-L-PI26 $707.79 $681.25 $664.63 1 Year
Softwarehouse 8 output relay bus module AS0074-000 $289.61 $278.75 $271.95 1 Year
SW House RM Enclosure RM-DCM-CAN $148.18 $142.63 $139.15 1 Year
Flexpass beige Arch Wallswitch Proximity Reader (Indala) FP4527A $141.56 $136.25 $132.93 1 Year
FlexPass Indala Long Range Reader Black ASR620+ $555.84 $535.00 $521.95 1 Year
Softwarehouse 8 Supervised input bus module AS0073-000 $279.22 $268.75 $262.20 1 Year
Card Reader (Apollo) AP-510 $889.61 $856.25 $835.37 1 Year
GE 1" Press Fit Door Contact R-1078 $7.73 $7.44 $7.26 1 Year
GE 1" Press Fit Door Contact 1076W $11.01 $10.60 $10.34 1 Year
SDC Door Contact MC-4M $55.19 $53.13 $51.83 1 Year
Honeywell Hardwired Hold-Up Switch 269R $18.62 $17.93 $17.49 1 Year
Request to Exit DS-151-1 $63.64 $61.25 $59.76 1 Year
Request to Exit DS160 $59.99 $57.74 $56.33 1 Year
TOTAL SECTION $27,825.25 | $26,781.80 $26,128.59

All equipment supplied must be new, unused and must be covered by current and existing manufacturer’s parts warranties

At time of purchase.Where applicable proposer shall supply warranty information with bid.

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

Name of Company___Johnson Controls, Inc

Date h.\\N\\.w\




Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291 Attachment A

W(CSU Security System Equipment

*+All Equipment Shall Be RoHS 2002/95/EC Compliant**

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

Halicdyw dba

NA Video

Manufacturer's

Description Item Number Qty. 1-10 Qty. 11-20 Qty. 20+ Warranty information
cCTV New Caxrk ¢ 2 %_ﬁ\m.
American Dynamics DVR- 16 channel anoeesttrse0 ADPEOOULPVIOG (L ou3—

American Dynamics Inteliex Ultra 1.5TB Abeepottris0 A DD O AU LP200 -710620~-

American Dynamics Intellex 8 Channel 500GB sosseonvmeso QDD B0 A IVNVOSH 33,1 -

American Dynamics extended memory unit 640G8 ESMG40 oObsolete e _ -

American Dynamics extended memory unit 178 ESM1000 Chsolere e = il

American Dynamics RAID Storage System, ISCS1, 3.0 T ADRSSO30TBH o b eyl Yo * See | airach

American Dynamics RAID Storage System, iSCS|, 12.0 TB High Performance ADRSS120TBHPH ObsSole¥e |M See hr.—.’.gva’

AD Megapower LT 16 channel matrix (supports UTC) pomperaeres ADMPLT b Te)—

AD modular matrix system bcmcsl _ m ﬂ @ -

American Dynamics PTZ Camera Kit rsarrorewA DS QUE me Pcw N — 7 9 ab -

American Dynamics PTZ Vil Camera rososTNADSDUE 350 PC W P lLkab~ | _ \

American Dynamics PTZ VIl Housing od.hb..s. or m.llbf S0-L Q?

flGouesms DS DU KOS

3Ha-

American Dynamics PTZ Ultra BE Kit ADSDUBE350PCWN q A@&@ -

American Dynamics PTZ Ultra 8E Camera No Base ADSDUSE3SN 12206~

American Dynamics PTZ Ultra 8E Camera With Base ADSDUBE35I0N 400~

American Dynamics Fixed Camera acomw ADLO YN ARMN ”-\

American Dynamics Fixed Camera bbb e >Ub 74 0’7«04-4 ﬂz _\mw -

American Dynamics Vandal Resistant Fixed Camera gﬁ* ABEFEe5E-24HM) ?VO?.J gb.._u& % ul— W -

Pelco Power Supply scaiso NO+a h_ook .ﬂo\- p— - - -
Pelco Power Supply MCS16-20 24/28VAC, 20A {480VA) bl — | FMW L



Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291 Attachment A WCSU Security System Equipment

**All Equipment Shall Be RoHS 2002/95/EC Compliant**

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

Manufacturer's

Description Item Number Qty. 1-10 Qty. 11-20 Qty. 20+ |warranty information
Panasonic PTZ Camera PA-WV-C5574 _— O\:b = w “urS.,
Interlogix Fixed Camera infoutdoor WDR 2.8mm - 10.5mm UVD-EVRDNR-VAS Now - d

Interlogix Fixed Camera in/outdoor WDR 9.0mm - 22.0mm UVD-EVRDNR-VAS m _m -

Interlogix Fixed Camera infoutdoor 2.8mm - 10.0mm UVD-6120VE-2-N — Eml -

Interlogix Fixed Camera WDR infoutdoor 2.8mm - 10.0mm UVD-6130VE-2-N NOW i

Interlogix Fixed Camera in/outdoor 2.8mm - 12mm TVD-7120VE-2-N ~\WO o r

Interlogix Fixed Camera IR infoutdoor 2.8mm - 12mm TVD-7125VE-2-N -1 W

TOTAL SECTION 4 Lolort —T—

All equipment supplied must be new, unused and must be covered by current and existing manufacturer’s parts warranties
At time of purchase.Where applicable proposer shall supply warranty information with bid.

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

Name of naaumglEth\.. wnrv-../kf—. f)r. .UV? Date

NOHh  Oumericom Vieken

A\ new poax S axe per the mamuSactuen

ey Riares = =



ESM640 IS OBSOLETE WITH NO REPLACEMENT
ESM1000 IS OBSOLETE WITH NO REPLACEMENT

ADRSS030TBH IS OBSOLETE. A SUGGESTED REPLACEMENT IS THE ADIRS3TO800W1R5. SEE BELOW. IT IS
AN 8TB INSTEAD OF THE 3TB.

ADRSS120TBHPH IS OBSOLETE. ASUGGESTED REPLACEMENT IS THE ADIRS2R1600W2R5. SEE BELOW. IT
IS A 16TB INSTEAD OF THE 12TB.

THESE ARE THE CLOSEST MODELS AD HAS TO OFFER TO COMPARE TO THE ORIGINALS.

AD RAID Storage (2nd Generation iSCSI Models for Intellex and HDVR)

ADIRS3TO800W1R | American Dynamics iSCSI Storage Tower 8TB RAID5, NTFS $5200.

5
ADIRS2R1600W2R | American Dynamics iSCSI RAID Storage, 3U Rack Mount, $11178.
5 16TB RAW or 14TB 2xRAID5, NTFS

NORTH AMERICAN YIDED, INC,
301 Drum Point Road
Brick, NI 08723 g
(732) 477-0686, Fax (732) 477-0886



Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291 Attachment A

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

WCSU Security System Equipment

liant*”

Manufacturer's

_omﬁ:uza: tem Number Qty. 1-10 Qty. 11-20 Qty. _N? Warranty information
American Dynamics DVR- 16 channel ADDEOOULPL00 ADDB0AULPV100 7215.70 7032.25 6848.80
American Dynamics inteliex Ultra 1578 ADDEOOULP150 ADD60AULPV300 9221.70 |8987.25 8752.80
American Dynamics fntelfex 8 Channel 500G8  ooovogss ADDBOADVDOS0 | 4088.94 308408 | 3881.02
American Dynamiics extended memary unit 640G8 ESMGAD 2350.28 2290.53 2230.77
American Dynamics extentded memory unit 178 ESMI000 3519.77 3430.29 3340.80
Amerlcan Dynamics RAID Storage System, ISCS1, 3.0 TR ADRSSOIOTEH No Bid No Bid No Bid )
Ametican Dynamics RAID Storage System, iSCSI, 12.0 T8 High Performance ADRSS120TBHPH 18425.70 17957.25 17488.80 -
A Megapowe 1T 16 channel matrix (supports UTC) {aomPLT-16 AD (No "AD" atend of Part#) | 954.39 930.12 905.86
2D modular matrlx system _— 193351 | 1884.35 1835.20 -
American Dynamics PTZ Camera Kit RASI170PCW 2309.98 2251.25 2192.52
American Dymamics PTZ Vil Camera aosunasy ADSUBE35N 1729.90 1685.92 1641.94 T
American Dynamiics PT2 Vil Housing aHobuLosfos RHOLDUL-01 1273.22 1240.85 1208.48
American Dynanics PTZ Ultra BE Kit ADSDUBE3FOPCWN 2081.05 2028.14 1975.23 )
Aemerican Dynamies PTZ Utra 8€ Gamtera No Base T 172990 | 168592 | 1641.94
American Dynamits PTZ Ultza 8E Camera With Base ADSDUREISION 1834.90 1788.256 1741.60
American Dynamics Fixed Camera ADLOMW No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Dynariics Fixed Camers aoconsssty ADCDH3895TN 28202 | 274.85 267.68 i
Ametican Dynamics Vandal Resistant Fixed Camera ADCTBOSD-24H(1) wwwmﬂméodz AND 1 202.96 197.80 192.64
ko power suppy_ Lfe/Safety/Power oz SCANIEO.8P 50116 | 57614 | 561.11
pelco Power Supply MCS 1620 24/2BVAC, 20A (AROVA) 180.22 17564 | 171.02 i o

Omni Data, LLC 5-12-2015



Price Sheet Bid # 2016-ERB-0291 Attachment A

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

WCSU Security System Equipment

hall Be RoH$ 2002/95/EC Compliant**

Manufacturer's

{Interlogix Fixed Camera IR infoutdoor 2.Bmm - 12mm

TVD-7125VE-2-N

Description _%mﬂunﬂwwrs = Qty. 1-10 Qty. 11-20 Qty. 20+ |warranty information
Panasonic PTZ Camera PA-WV.CS574 WVCS584A 1222.91 1191.81 1160.73 AN\
InteHogix Fixed Camera infoutdoor WDR 2.8mm - 10.5mm UVD-EVRDNR-VAS 355.86 346.82 337.77 1 r HJ
Interlogix Fixed Camera in/outdoor WDR 9.0mm - 22.0mm UVD-EVRDNR-VAZ No Bid No Bid No Bid ,M,L,c
interlogix Fixed Camera In/outdvor 2.8mm - 10 mm UVD-6120VE-2-N 186.51 | 181.77 177.03 Y )
| nterlogix Fixed Camera WDR infoutdoor 2.8mm - 10.0mm UVD-6130VE-2-N 229.65 223.82 217.98 ﬁrr_ ﬂ@t
intariontt e Camers IeukiB00¢ 2,8hw - 126w TVOTL20VE 2N 146.25 | 142.53 138.81 /% ™
175.50 171.04 166.58

TOTAL SECTHON

Al equipment supplied must be new, unused and must be covered by current and existing manufacturer’s parts warranties

At time of purchase. Where applicable proposer shali supply warranty information with bid.

Prices quoted must be firm fixed for 2 years

Name ﬂﬁ ﬁﬂaﬁﬂ_.—< Og_.._— _Um_nm_ _l_lo

Date

5-12-2015




